
 

  From: "Daniels, Mark (DEQ)" [DANIELSM@michigan.gov] 
  Sent: 01/26/2012 08:05 AM EST 
  To: Jeffrey Lippert 
  Subject: FW: letter dated 1-12-12 

 
FYI 
  

From: Gerald Keast [mailto:jerrykeast@gmail.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, January 25, 2012 5:31 PM 
To: Daniels, Mark (DEQ) 
Subject: letter dated 1-12-12 
  
Mr. Daniels, 
  
In response to your letter of 1-12-12 Detroit Tubular Rivet will not be able to address all of your 
violations. Because of Citizens Bank calling in a loan DTR was forced into bankruptcy and ultimatly 
total liquidation.  DTR closed it's doors in Aug of 2011 ,A auction took place in Sept of 2011 and all of 
DTR's assets were sold off and the proceeds were kept by Citizens.  
The JUly violations you mentioned in your letter were not addressd because two weeks later DTR did 
not exist. In fact what you saw on your Dec visit was what was left after the auction. Citizens Bank did 
state that they would take care of the enviormental issues, in fact it is part of their inventory. 
i was able to place all containers inside the building with lids attached and cover the filter cake with a 
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tarp that sits in the west side truck well.  i am working on the removal of the filter cake but so far no 
luck.  As of now i am jobless with no money coming in to pay for any disposal fees.  since DTR is 
closed many of the violations in your letter should be addressed  any questions please feel free to contact 
me. 
  
Regards, 
Jerry Keast 
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